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Ok, we will fix your article and send it to reviewers. We fixed the email.
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We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.

On Sat, Mar 5, 2022 at 1:56 AM Ulul Azmi Muhammad <spartauam.20@gmail.com> wrote:
We agree with the publication fee and please continue the evaluation process
There is one thing that needs to be fixed for Dr. email. Farida Ariyani is farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id. Please contact that email for news regarding our journal's receipt for
processing.

Thank you

Best Regards
Ulul Azmi Muhammad

Pada tanggal Sab, 5 Mar 2022 pukul 05.03 International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> menulis:
Dear Dr. Ariyani,
We are happy to announce that the 1JI is now Scopus Q1.
We received your article, and thank you for submitting the article to ZJI for publication.

After a pre-assessment with careful consideration by the members of the Editorial Board and Executive Committee, your article was decided to be
accepted for further evaluation processes. However, your manuscript was found not to be proper according to our journal’s standards, it needs revision, we
will fix your article.

Meanwhile, you will need to pay 1000 EUR for the expenses of your article if your article is accepted for publication. If it is acceptable for you, let us
know, and then we will start the article evaluation process. We will send you payment information after the evaluation process, if your article is
accepted for publication. (Note: 1000 EUR be paid by all authors of an article all together. Each author does not pay separately. The Journal management
has the right to change the amount when it deems necessary.) Could you please confirm the receipt of this e-mail?

Sincerely yours,
Editorial Office
International Journal of Instruction

Note: International Journal of Instruction has a wide range of abstracting/indexing services. However, the index services have the right of one-sided
termination of the contracts and not to publish any of the articles. Therefore, we do not accept any responsibilities caused by indexing problems.
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We are happy to announce that the 1JI is now Scopus Q1.

First name: Farida

Last name : Ariyani

Title (Mrs/Ms/Dr etc): Dr

Your email: : dulifarida@gmail.com

Scope of the Article:: teachereducation

Article subject : Lampung Language Online Learning during the COVID-19 Outbreak: How are the Teacher’s TPACK Skills?

Add article (doc, docx) : https://www.e-iji.net/upload/2022_02_08_06_52_04_lampunglanguageonlinelearningduringthecovid19outbreakhowaret
heteacherstpackskills.doc

Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id> Sun, Mar 6, 2022 at 1:00 PM
To: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>
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Thank you

Best Regards

Farida Ariyani
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Dear author

We fixed your article and sent it to reviewers. You can see our revision on the attached file. Thank you very much for your interest in 1JI.

Sincerely yours,
International Journal of Instruction
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To: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

thank you for the information, | really hope that my article can be accepted in this journal
Thank You
Best Regards

Farida Ariyani
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Revision from manuscript 020322
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Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id> Thu, Jun 9, 2022 at 12:46 PM
To: iji@ogu.edu.tr

Dear Team and the Chief Editor of International Journal of Instruction

We have tried to revise our manuscript based on all reviewer's comments. We also have added some current references from I1JI to our manuscript related to our topic. We
attach the revised manuscript and the document "Changes made" in this email. We hope that we can receive the feedback from you soon on our revised manuscript. Thank

you for your attention and understanding.
Best regards

Author(s)
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International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> Mon, May 16, 2022 at 2:21 AM
To: dulifarida@gmail.com, abuazisah59@yahoo.co.id, edisuyanto1963@gmail.com, Ulul Azmi Muhammad <spartauam.20@gmail.com>, farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id

Dear author

You have amendments from reviewers. Could you please amend on attached file “Article 020322_for revision” and send back your revised article and the list of
explanations of the revisions done via e-mail (iji@ogu.edu.tr) as an attached file as soon as possible?

So far, a lot of articles have been published in the International Journal of Instruction on a wide range of subjects. To promote our international and scientific
community, we kindly ask our writers to make references to other articles published in our journal. By doing this, you will help us to improve the 1JI and as
other writers will possibly reference your article, your article gets citations. Thus, as a final touch, we kindly ask you to make references to two or
more articles from the 1JI.

Note: Please contact us only with this editor.eiji@gmail.com mail for your article from now on. Others will not be considered. You could see our valid
email on: http://lwww.e-iji.net/about-us

Sincerely yours,
International Journal of Instruction

International Journal of Instruction
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We are happy to announce that the 1JI is now Scopus Q1.
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@ Article 020322_c.doc
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@ IJI Article Evaluation Form 020322a.pdf
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.E IJI Article Evaluation Form 020322c.pdf
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ﬂ IJI Article Evaluation Form 020322d.pdf
144K

Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id> Sat, Jul 2, 2022 at 11:56 AM
To: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Dear the Editor of International Journal of Instruction

This email wants to confirm regarding the progress of our manuscript revision now. We have revised the manuscript with the title "Lampung Language Online Learning during the
COVID-19 Outbreak: How are the Teachers' TPACK Skills?". In addition, we sent it to the email " iji@ogu.edu.tr " three weeks ago. Have you received our email related to the
collection of our manuscript consisting of revised manuscript and change made file? We hope you can provide clear information about it. Thank you for your attention and
understanding.

Best Regards

Authors
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International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> Sun, Jul 3, 2022 at 8:54 AM
To: Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id>, dulifarida@gmail.com, abuazisah59@yahoo.co.id, edisuyanto1963@gmail.com, Ulul Azmi Muhammad
<spartauam.20@gmail.com>

Dear Dr. Ariyani,
We received your revised article and sent it to reviewers.

Please contact us only with this editor.eiji@gmail.com mail for your article. Others will not be considered. You could see our valid email on:
http://www.e-iji.net/about-us

Sincerely yours,
International Journal of Instruction
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Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id> Tue, Sep 6, 2022 at 2:36 PM
To: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Dear the Editor of International Journal of Instruction

This email wants to confirm the progress of our manuscript revision with the title "Lampung Language Online Learning during the COVID-19 Outbreak: How are the Teachers'
TPACK Skills?". We hope you can provide clear information about it. Thank you for your attention and understanding.

Best Regards

Authors
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International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> Wed, Sep 7, 2022 at 4:03 AM
To: Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id>, dulifarida@gmail.com, abuazisah59@yahoo.co.id, edisuyanto1963@gmail.com, Ulul Azmi Muhammad
<spartauam.20@gmail.com>

Dear Dr. Ariyani,
“Article 020322”

This article has been completed the reviewing process and has been accepted for publication. Your manuscript is tentatively scheduled for publication in the
January 2023 issue. (Note: If in an issue the place opens up, articles from the next issue are taken in here.)

Please contact us only with this editor.eiji@gmail.com mail for your article from now on. Others will not be considered. You could see our valid email on:
http://www.e-iji.net/about-us

We wish you all the best.
Editor

International Journal of Instruction
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We are happy to announce that the 1JI is now Scopus Q1.
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Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id> Wed, Sep 7, 2022 at 9:06 AM
To: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Dear the Editor of International Journal of Instruction

Thank you so much for the information. How is the publication fee? How much do we have to pay? Where is that we have to send the publication fee? We will wait the
information and instruction.

Best regards

Authors
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International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> Thu, Sep 8, 2022 at 2:29 AM
To: Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id>, dulifarida@gmail.com, abuazisah59@yahoo.co.id, edisuyanto1963@gmail.com, Ulul Azmi Muhammad
<spartauam.20@gmail.com>

Dear Dr. Ariyani,

You don't need to transfer right now. We will inform you about progress and your payment while your article is published. However, if you wish to make the
transfer now, we may send the payment information for your article’s expenses (1000EUR).

Sincerely yours,

Publishing Officer

International Journal of Instruction

http://www.e-iji.net

http://www.gate-academy.ch

We are happy to announce that the 1JI is now Scopus Q1.
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Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id> Tue, Sep 13, 2022 at 2:44 PM
To: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Dear the Editor of International Journal of Instruction

Team and | have agreed to transfer the publication fee now. How about the procedure to pay for it?
Thank you for your attention and understanding.
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Best Regards

Authors
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International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> Tue, Sep 13, 2022 at 8:40 PM
To: Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id>, dulifarida@gmail.com, abuazisah59@yahoo.co.id, edisuyanto1963@gmail.com, Ulul Azmi Muhammad
<spartauam.20@gmail.com>

Dear Dr. Ariyani,

Ok, we will send you payment information for the expenses of your article. But, some authors' payments went back, so we could not get them. While you
transfer your payment, please do not write anything as explanation-information-purpose of payment, transaction remarks or purpose, message etc. If
you absolutely have to write please write only “For Gift” If you write something else, we are having trouble in the bank account. Could you please don't
write anything else.

Would you please follow in accordance with our instructions?

Please contact us only with this editor.eiji@gmail.com mail for your article from now on. Others will not be considered. You could see our valid email on:
http://www.e-iji.net/about-us

Sincerely yours,
Publishing Officer

International Journal of Instruction
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We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.
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Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id> Tue, Sep 13, 2022 at 11:09 PM
To: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Dear the Editor of International Journal of Instruction

Alright, we will follow in accordance with your instructions. We will await your information regarding the procedure of transferring the publication fee. Thank you for your attention
and understanding.

Best regards

Authors
[Quoted text hidden]

International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> Wed, Sep 14, 2022 at 9:52 AM
To: Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id>

Dear Dr. Ariyani,
Ok, we trust you. Please never make a transfer if you cannot follow our following instructions.

If possible could you please transfer I000EUR via fast transfer in a few days. Otherwise it comes too late, sometimes it may take a month to arrive. Please
don’t transfer via Western Union, we can not receive it.

(Note: All extra fees per transaction for bank charges (intermediary and local banks) belong to the author. We can’t send any receipt or invoice. After
payment it will not be refunded.)

While you transfer your payment, please do not write anything as explanation-information-purpose of payment, transaction remarks or
purpose, message etc.
If you absolutely have to write please write only “For Gift”. Could you please don't write anything else.

Account information for 1000 EUR

The name of the account holder: OMER ARI
FINANCIAL INSTITUTION: Tiirkiye Finans
SWIFT CODE: AFKBTRISXXX

BANK CODE/ABA: 360

ACCOUNT: 3862703-102

IBAN: TR870020600013038627030102
Address of the bank: Tiirkiye Finans, TURKEY

Please contact us only with this editor.eiji@gmail.com mail for your article from now on. Others will not be considered. You could see our valid email on:
http://www.e-iji.net/about-us

Note: International Journal of Instruction has a wide range of abstracting/indexing services. However, the index services have the right of one-sided
termination of the contracts and not to publish any of the articles. Therefore, we do not accept any responsibilities caused by indexing problems.

Sincerely yours,
Publishing Officer

International Journal of Instruction
http://www.e-iji.net
http://www.gate-academy.ch
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Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id> Thu, Sep 22, 2022 at 3:11 PM

To: arman95@upi.edu
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Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id> Thu, Sep 22, 2022 at 6:39 PM

To: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Dear the Editor of International Journal of Instruction

We have conducted the publication payment related to our manuscript. The following payment proof is attached. By the way, can we ask for the Letter of Acceptance of our
manuscript? We will await the next information from you. Thank you for your attention and understanding.

Best Regards

Authors
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To: Farida Ariyani <farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id>

Dear Dr. Ariyani,

Thank you. We attached your LoA.

Sincerely yours
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<farida.ariyani@fkip.unila.ac.id>
Dear author,

We published your article as OnlineFirst. You can see your article on the web https://www.e-iji.net/volumes/372-onlinefirst

Lampung Language Online Learning during the Covid-19 Outbreak: How are the Teacher’s TPACK Skills?
Farida Ariyani, Muhammad Fuad, Edi Suyanto, Ulul Azmi Muhammad

We will publish as home pages on January 01, 2023.

Note: No changes can be made to the article after 48 hours of publication.
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