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M Gma i | DEDY MISWAR <dedy.miswar@fkip.unila.ac.id>

Fwd: [IUPSAT] Editor Decision

Houda E.A <ijpsat@gmail.com> Fri, Jul 30, 2021 at 9:01 PM
To: DEDY MISWAR <dedy.miswar@fkip.unila.ac.id>

Dear Dedy Miswar:
I'd like to inform you that your paper was published in the I[JPSAT July in press Issue (Vol. 27, No.2).

You can check the publication at:

https://ijpsat.ijsht-journals.org/index.php/ijpsat/issue/view/59
and you can download the paper from this link:
https://ijpsat.ijsht-journals.org/index.php/ijpsat/article/download/3241/2030

Please accept our regards and thanks for contributing to IJPSAT Journal.

Editorial Team.
IJPSAT

[Quoted text hidden]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=ec67a750e6&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1706718619105755144&simpl=msg-f%3A170671... 1/1


https://ijpsat.ijsht-journals.org/index.php/ijpsat/issue/view/59
https://ijpsat.ijsht-journals.org/index.php/ijpsat/article/download/3241/2030

11/10/22, 8:12 AM unila.ac.id Mail - Fwd: [IJPSAT] Editor Decision

M Gma i | DEDY MISWAR <dedy.miswar@fkip.unila.ac.id>

Fwd: [IUPSAT] Editor Decision

Houda E.A <ijpsat@gmail.com> Sun, Jul 11, 2021 at 7:48 PM
To: dedy.miswar@fkip.unila.ac.id

---------- Forwarded message ---------

De : Houda E.A <ijpsat@gmail.com>

Date: dim. 11 juil. 2021 a 13:34

Subject: [I[JPSAT] Editor Decision

To: Dedy miswar Miswar <dedy.miswar1974@gmail.com>

Dear Dedy miswar Miswar:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to the International Journal of Progressive Sciences and
Technologies, "STUDY OF LAND USE CHANGES WITH SPATIAL APPROACH SUKOHARJO DISTRICT,
PRINGSEWU REGENCY".

Our decision is to:

In order to schedule your paper for publication, pay the publication fee by logging in your IJPSAT account and click on
“PAY TO PUBLISH*

N.B: if you want to pay with Western Union, Our Western Union information is as follow .

Last name: JAOUJAL

First name: ACHRAF

Country: MOROCCO

Address: 3 Rue Ennajm, Touabel Soufla, 93045 TETOUAN.
Phone: +212666659988

Please tell me the MTCN after payment.

If you have any questions, please contact me.

Please accept our regards and thanks for contributing to IJPSAT .

Co-Editor
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Perincian ~

1x Article Publication $30,00 UsSD
No. Barang #: 3279

Subtotal $30,00 UsD
Pajak $0,00 UsD
Pengiriman $0,00 usD
Asuransi $0,00 USD
Penanganan $0,00 usD
Total $30,00 UsD
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