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7 messages

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Thu, May 17, 2018 at 1:05 PM
To: ygliklikh@gmail.com, gsa.editor@gmail.com

Dear Prof.
Yuri E. Gliklikh


Editor in Chief 

Global and Sthochastic Analysis


I have submitted our paper to GSA last week, but I have not received any news from the office.

Could you please inform us whether the article has been been safely received.


Thank you.


Best regards,


Dian Kurniasari 


Yuri Gliklikh <ygliklikh@gmail.com> Thu, May 17, 2018 at 4:19 PM
To: DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id>

The office has not send your paper to me. Please send it to me. 
[Quoted text hidden]

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Fri, May 18, 2018 at 8:06 AM
To: Yuri Gliklikh <ygliklikh@gmail.com>

Dear Prof.
Yuri E. Gliklikh


Editor in Chief 

Global and Sthochastic Analysis



I have submitted through online system.

Please find attached the paper that has been submitted to GSA.


Best regards,


Dian Kurniasari

Vice Dean of Finance and General Affairs

Faculty of Mathematics and Natural Sciences

Universitas Lampung Indonesia

[Quoted text hidden]

2 attachments

Kurniasari et al.docx

98K

Plagiarism report_SIMULATION_FOR_PARAMETERS_ESTIMATION-ilovepdf-compressed-ilovepdf-
compressed.pdf

1321K

Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com> Fri, May 18, 2018 at 12:03 PM
To: DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id>

Dear Prof. Dian, 
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The article is received safely and it is been forwarded to the concern team for the review process. 

with regards, 

Serials Publications 

[Quoted text hidden]

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Tue, Jun 26, 2018 at 7:28 AM
To: Yuri Gliklikh <ygliklikh@gmail.com>

Dear Prof.
Yuri E. Gliklikh


Editor in Chief 

Global and Sthochastic Analysis 


I really ask your apology, has the review of our manuscript has been finalized?
I am very sorry as one of our colleagues really need it for the promotion in the office.

Thank you for your kindness and help. Look forward to hearing from you.

Best regards,

Dian Kurniasari


On Thu, May 17, 2018 at 4:19 PM, Yuri Gliklikh <ygliklikh@gmail.com> wrote:

[Quoted text hidden]

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Mon, Jul 23, 2018 at 12:36 PM
To: Yuri Gliklikh <ygliklikh@gmail.com>

Dear Prof.
Yuri E. Gliklikh


Editor in Chief 

Global and Sthochastic Analysis 


I really ask your apology, has the review of our manuscript has been finalized?
I am very sorry as one of our colleagues really need it for the promotion in the office.

Thank you for your kindness and help. Look forward to hearing from you as soon as possible.


Best regards,

A/Prof. Dian Kurniasari

[Quoted text hidden]

Yuri Gliklikh <ygliklikh@gmail.com> Mon, Jul 23, 2018 at 8:36 PM
To: DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id>

Unfortunately I have no informations about your paper. Please contact the publishers. Sorry.
[Quoted text hidden]

mailto:ygliklikh@gmail.com
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DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id>

We have received your response for ONLINE SUBMISSION SYSTEM

3 messages

JotForm <noreply@jotform.com> Wed, May 9, 2018 at 11:11 AM
Reply-To: vinaykumar23.india@gmail.com
To: dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id

ONLINE SUBMISSION SYSTEM

Name Dian
 Kurniasari

Organisation DEPARTMENT OF MATHEMATICS, FACULTY OF
MATHEMATICS AND NATURAL
SCIENCES,
UNIVERSITAS LAMPUNG, INDONESIA

Subject and keywords Survival
Analysis, Right Censored Data, Type II
Censoring, Weibull Distribution, Maximum
Likelihood Estimation

Journal Name Global
and Stochastic Analysis

Article Title SIMULATION FOR PARAMETERS ESTIMATION
OF TYPE II RIGHT CENSORED DATA
FROM
WEIBULL DISTRIBUTION BASED ON SEVERAL
INTENSITIES

E-mail dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id

Phone Number (62813)
69059733

I
agreed with the Terms and Conditions of the
publications. I am well aware that
publisher is only
liable for the publication. Selection and Rejection is
sole
right of Editor and publisher.

Attachment (Article) Kurniasari
et al.docx

Plagiarism Report Plagiarism
report_SIMULATION_FOR_
PARAMETERS_ESTIMATION(1).pdf

Now create your
own JotForm - It’s free! Create
a JotForm

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Wed, May 9, 2018 at 4:50 PM
To: Sutopo Hadi <sutopo.hadi@fmipa.unila.ac.id>

[Quoted text hidden]

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Tue, Feb 12, 2019 at 4:46 PM
To: warsono.1963@fmipa.unila.ac.id

[Quoted text hidden]
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DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id>

Ask your apology (Re: has the review has been finalized for Our article submitted
to GSA)

15 messages

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Mon, Jul 30, 2018 at 6:58 AM
To: Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com>

Dear Editor
Global and Stocastic Analysis,

I
really ask your apology. three months ago I have submitted our latest
manuscript to GSA, but until now I have not
received any news from you.
I have contacted Prof. Yuri but he suggested me to contact you directly.

Could you please inform us the outcome of our paper. Since one of the authors need it for his promotion in his office.

Thank you and look forward to hearing from you soon.

Best regards,

A/Prof. Dian Kurniasari


On Tue, Jul 24, 2018 at 8:25 AM, DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> wrote:

Dear Editor
Global and Stocastic Analysis,


I really ask your apology. three months ago I have submitted our latest manuscript to GSA, but until now I have not
received any news from you.
I have contacted Prof. Yuri but he suggested me to contact you directly.


Could you please inform us the outcome of our paper. Since one of the authors need it for his promotion in his
office.


Thank you and look forward to hearing from you soon.


Best regards,


A/Prof. Dian Kurniasari



On Fri, May 18, 2018 at 12:03 PM, Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com> wrote:








Dear Prof. Dian, 


The article is received safely and it is been forwarded to the concern team for the review process. 


with regards, 


Serials Publications 






On Thu, May 17, 2018 at 11:35 AM, DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> wrote:


Dear Prof.
Yuri E. Gliklikh


Editor in Chief 

Global and Sthochastic Analysis



I have submitted our paper to GSA last week, but I have not received any news from the office.


mailto:dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id
mailto:gsa.editor@gmail.com
mailto:dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id
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Could you please inform us whether the article has been been safely received.



Thank you.



Best regards,



Dian Kurniasari 







Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com> Mon, Jul 30, 2018 at 6:39 PM
To: DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id>

Dear Author, 


Thanks for your e-mail. We would like to inform you that their is large number of submission for the journal and the space is in
the journal is very limited. We have to go by the regular process of review to select the article. 
In case, you are in hurry, you can withdraw your article and submit it to any other journal for the review. 

Thanks again, 

Customer Support Team, Global and Stochastic Analysis

[Quoted text hidden]

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Tue, Jul 31, 2018 at 7:05 AM
To: Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com>

Dear Editor of Global and Stochastic Analysis

Okay, We will wait the process of review.
I ask your apology.

But we hope it can be finalized soon and look forward to receiving the result of review,

Once again I ask your apology.

All the best,

Best regards,

Dian Kurniasari

[Quoted text hidden]

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Thu, Feb 7, 2019 at 4:12 PM
To: Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com>

Dear Editor
Global and Stocastic Analysis,

I
really ask your apology. Seven months ago I have submitted our latest
manuscript to GSA, but until now I have
not received any news from you.
I have contacted Prof. Yuri but he suggested me to contact you directly.

Could you please inform us the outcome of our paper. Since one of the authors need it for his promotion in his
office.

Thank you and look forward to hearing from you soon.

Best regards,
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A/Prof. Dian Kurniasari

[Quoted text hidden]

Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com> Fri, Feb 8, 2019 at 6:28 PM
To: DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id>

Dear Author, 

We would like to inform you that your article seem suitable for the publication in the journal.The publication charge in the journal
is $ 1500. We request you to kindly confirm, so that we can proceed further./ 

with regards, 

ABHINAV 
[Quoted text hidden]

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Mon, Feb 11, 2019 at 12:45 PM
To: Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com>

Dear Editor of GSA,

Is it really the publication charge is $1,500? No discount for authors of developing countries?

We look forward to hearing from you asap.

Thank you.

Regards,

Dian
[Quoted text hidden]

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Tue, Feb 12, 2019 at 4:21 PM
To: Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com>

Dear Editor of GSA,

We are really waiting the info from you about the publication charge.
However, since no reply, Ok, please send the invoice so we can proceed further for payment.
Hope it can be included in the June edition, 2019.

Thank you and best regards,
Dian
[Quoted text hidden]

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Tue, Feb 12, 2019 at 4:48 PM
To: warsono.1963@fmipa.unila.ac.id

[Quoted text hidden]

Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com> Mon, Feb 18, 2019 at 1:56 PM
To: DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id>

Dear Author, 
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Many thanks for your e-mail. We would like to inform you that January-June, 2019 issue of the journal is already finalized. Your
article will be included in July_December 2019 issue of the journal. You are requested to complete the formalities including the
copy right, formatting the article in the desired format of the journal and charges for the publications. 

Thanks again, 

ABHI

[Quoted text hidden]

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Tue, Feb 19, 2019 at 4:23 PM
To: Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com>

Dear Editorof GSA,
1. We agree to pay the publication fee.
2. We will format the article as requested by GSA.
3. We really need the journal before June 2019, is it possible to be included in January-June 2019 Edition?

Thank you and look forward to hearing from you.

Best regards,
Dian 
[Quoted text hidden]

Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com> Thu, Feb 21, 2019 at 5:19 PM
To: DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id>

Dear Prof. Lee, 


Many thanks for your e-mail. We are very happy to inform you that your article will is selected for the publication in the "Global
and Stochastic Analysis". We request you to kindly send the copy right of your article along with the formatted article in the
style of the GSA and article processing fee of $ 1500.  


I am sending you the link for downloading the copy right form and style of the GSA. 

https://www.mukpublications.com/gsa-instruction-to-authors.php    (copy right)


GSA_format.tex 


You can send the payment using the follwoing bank details. 

Name of the Account Holder: MIND READER PUBLICATIONS 

 

1. Bank Name and Address: IndusInd Bank, Rohini Branch, New Delhi, India

 

2. Account Number: 200007960431     in name of ‘Mind Reader Publications‘

 

3. Swift Code: INDBINBBXXX 


with regards, 

ABHINAV PANT

HEAD CUSTOMER SUPPORT TEAM
[Quoted text hidden]

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Wed, Mar 6, 2019 at 12:15 PM
To: Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com>

https://www.mukpublications.com/gsa-instruction-to-authors.php
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Dear Editor
Global and Stochastic Analysis

Please find attached:
1. The proof of payment of publication charge
2. The revised manuscript based on the guideline
3. Copy right.

We still expect that our paper be published on January-June 2019 Edition.

Thank you and look forward to hearing from you when the payment has been received.
Note: May name is Dian Kurniasari not Prof. Lee.

Best regards,

A/Prof. Dian Kurniasari
Department of Mathematics, University of Lampung, Bandar Lampung, Indonesia

[Quoted text hidden]

3 attachments

Payment to GSA_Dian Kurniasari.jpg

3928K

COPYRIGHT FORM.doc

31K

Kurniasari et al. formatted GSA.docx

98K

Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com> Wed, Mar 6, 2019 at 1:13 PM
To: DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id>

Dear Prof. Dian, 

Many thanks for your e-mail and sending the article processing charges, and copy right. We have forwarded the same to the
account sections. We will acknowledge the safe receipt of the payment as soon we get the confirmation from the accounts. 

In the meantime, we request you to kindly format your article accordingly to the style of the GSA. I am sending you the LATEX
sample 

Thanks again, 

with regards, 

ABHI

 

[Quoted text hidden]
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DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Wed, Mar 6, 2019 at 1:29 PM
To: Dwi Sakethi <dwijim@fmipa.unila.ac.id>, Dwi Sakethi <dwi.sakethi@fmipa.unila.ac.id>

Terlampir format latex dan juga jurnal saya attached.
[Quoted text hidden]

Kurniasari et al. formatted GSA.docx

98K

DIAN KURNIASARI <dian.kurniasari@fmipa.unila.ac.id> Fri, Mar 22, 2019 at 8:11 AM
To: Global and Stochastic Analysis <gsa.editor@gmail.com>

Dear Editor of Global and Stochastic Analysis

Please find attached our article which has been formatted in latex.
We still request if possible please published in January-June 2019 Edition.

Thank you.

Best regards,

A/Prof. Dian Kurniasari
[Quoted text hidden]

journal_gsa_final.zip

319K
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