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Yahoo/Terkirim

Submit Asmiati's Paper

Asmiati Asmiati <azmiati308@yahoocom> = @ Kamn, 4 Jul 2019 jam 09.52
Kepada: editor@ijcsns.org, ijcsns@gmail.com =
Dear Editor IJCENS,

| have submitted our paper entitled " On the locating chromatic number of subdivizion of barbell graph: containing generalized Feterzen Graphs" Plaase find gur paper in attachment files.
Thank you wery much for your cooperation.

Best regards,
Asmiat

i Unduh sermua lampiran sebagai file zip

Asmiati’s C_.. docx OM THE LO....docx
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Re: Submit Asmiati's Paper Yahoo/Email M...
g LICSMS Editor <ijcsns@gmail.com > ] Karm, 4 Jul 2019 jam 10,07
I E Kepada: Asmiati Asmizti =

Thank you for your submitted paper and copyright form. The paper will be evaluated by three anonymous reviewers and the results
will be announced up to July 20. If you have any question in the processing, please contact me at editor@ijcsns.org. Thank you.

Kind regards,
Editor.

COn Wed, Jul 3, 2018 at 10:52 PM Asmiati Asmiati <asmiati308@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear Editor IJC5NS,

| have submitted our paper entitled " On the locating chromatic number of subdivision of barbell graphs containing generalized Petersen Graphs™ Please find gur paper in attachment
files. Thank you very much for your cooperation.

Best regards,
Asmiat
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Cn Mon, Jul 22, 2019 at 8:28 AM |JCSENS Editor <jjcsnsi@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Asmiati, I Ketut Sadha Gunce Yana, Lyra Yulianti,

Thank you for your submitted paper. It is my pleasure to announce an acceptance notification for publication in July issues

"ON THE LOCATING CHROMATIC NUMBER OF SUBDIVISION OF BARBELL GRAPHS CONTAINING GENERALIZED
PETERSEN GRAPH."

The paper was evaluated as reviewer's comments. If you want to modify, please resubmit the revised paper up to July 30. It will
be published on July 30 and delivered up to August 30, 2019.

Please send me the scanned bank proofs if deposit directly into our account :.

MName of Account: [JCSNS

Bank Mame: Woorl Bank

Swift Code: HVBKKRSE

Bank Account{IBM) # 1081-200-245654
Bank Address: Soongsil University Branch,
Sangdo 5 dong 1-1, Dongjack gu,

Seoul | 156-743, Korea

Fublication Fee: $USD 400

] —

Mame of Account: Moon-Seog Jun (Editor)
Korea Exchange Bank

Swift Code: KOEXKRSE

Bank Account(IBM) #: 085-J3D-100270-5
Bank Address: Sang-Do Branch,

Sangdo 5 dong 1-1, Dongjack gu,

Senul 15R-TAR Knorea
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Fwd: Acceptance Motification Yahoo Email M.

= B Sel, 30 Jul 2019 jam 1117

ﬂ‘ ASMIATI 1976 <azmisti 1976 @fmipa.unilaacid> =
=\ Kepada: asmiati303@yahoo.com =

----- — Forwarded message -—-—-—--

From: ASMIATI 1976 =asmisti. 1976@fmipa.unila sc.id=
Date: Tue, Jul 30, 2012 at 11:08 AM

Subject: Re: Acceptance Motification

To: LJCSNS Editor <ijcsnsi@gmail. com>

Dear LJCSNS Editor,

Please find a payment receipt in attachment. Thank you wery much for your cooperation.

Bestregards,
Asmiat

On Mon, Jul 28, 2019 at 8:58 AM |JCSNE Editor <ijcsnsi@gmail.com> wrote:
Thank you for your final paper.

Editor.
2o 7 282 (B) 23 0:40, ASMIATI 1076 =asmisti 1875@fmipa.unils ac.id=5 0| &H4-

Dear IJCENS Editor,
Thank you very for your information, | have sent final file of our paper. | am going to pay publication fee soon.

Bast regards,
Asmiati




