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Email Masuk 40
) AESS Journal =status@aessweb.com: =1 Sel, 30 Marjam 13.17 AESS Journal o
Belum Dibaca Kepada: Flora Mainggolan
Beilims status@aessweb.com
erbintang 5 s : c ] ; 3 +Tambah ke kontak
Thank you for your email. Your article is under evaluation. As the evaluation process of your article will be completed, we will
Draft 423 inform you about the editorial decision.
Terkirim
Arsip v Sembunyikan pesan asli
Spam On Man, Mar 29, 2021 at 6:52 PM Flora Nainggolan <painggolan flora@yahoo coms wrote: 3
Sampah Dear editor,
. o | have submitted my manuscript to your journal { International journal of English language and literature studies=lJELLS).
~ Lebih sedikit | look foward to hearing futher information. Thank you.
Best regards,
Tamp... Sembunyikan Fiors
M roto
B Dokumen -
— David Paul
i== Langganan
g< PEERE Editorizl Office
2637 E Atlantic Blvd #4310
Pompanc Baach, FL 33082
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(¥ Emeail:status @ sessweb.com;editor@aessweb.com
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Editorial Decision: Article ID- JELLS/1109/2021 & ¥ahoo/Emall M. W

Email Masuk 40
AESS Journal o

Belum Dibaca @ AESS Journal <status@aessweb.com= = Sel BAprjam 1853 W

/ e status@aessweb.com
Berbintang Kepada: nainggolanflora@yahoo.com i
Draft 473

Dear Flora
Terkirim A
ions!

A Congratulations!
Spam We are happy to let you know that your article “Exploring Foreign Language [earners’
Sarpah Perceptions during the Negotiation of Meaning: Unfocused Task and Focused Task” has been

selected for publication in International Journal of English Language and Literature Studies. Your

~ Lebih sedikit article was evaluated in a blind review process by two referees. Your article will be available online
within 90 working days after receiving the publication fee.

Tamp... Sembunyikan

E! Foto

B Dokumen 1. Journal Archive: http://www.aessweb.com/journals/5019/info/maore
2. Indexed/abstracted in: http://www.aessweb.com/journals/5019/info/ii

Important Links:
Business Continuity Planning

Discover the tools & strategies 1o
keep business moving at all times,
Im any situation,

(F— Langganan

8-( Promo

Publication fee: Publication Process Fee of your article is USD 1500 that includes English editing,
proofreading and processing charges. Please pay the total USD 1500 of article processing charges
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Terkirim

Arsip
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Sampah

~ Lebih sedikit

Tamp... Sembunyikan

E! Foto
B Dokumen
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Re: Manuseript subm
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Publication fee: Publication Process Fee of your article is USD 1500 that includes English editing,
proofreading and processing charges. Please pay the total USD 1500 of article processing charges
by clicking the link below:

https://fwww.2checkout.com/checkout/purchase?sid=1987 380&total=1500.00&
cart order_id=Publication%20Feefc prod=038&id_type=28lang=en&imode=new&fixed=Y

Please remember to quote the manuscript number, IJELLS/1109/2021, whenever inguiring about
your manuscript. After receiving your publication process fee, we will publish your article in the
upcoming issue.

Please acknowledge the receiving of acceptance letter.
We would be glad to assist you further.

With best regards,

Cavid Paul

Editorizl Office

2637 E Atlantic Bhed £43110
Fompano Besch, FL 33062
usa
Email:status@aessweb. com; editor@aessweb. com
Tel, +15184073707
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fa)
Email Masuk 40 AESS Journal <status@aessweb.com= = Kkam, 8 Aprjam 1208 W
Baliin Dilaia Kepada: Flora Mainggolan AESS Journal o
/ ) ) status@aessweb.com
Berbintang Thanks for your email. We can't reduce the fee. Please send us a scan copy of payment proof after making the payment to start s TFambah ke kontak
Draft 453 the publication process of your article. Thanks
Terkirim “ Sembunyikan pesan ashi
Arsip On Wed, Apr 7, 2021 at 7:42 PM Flora Nainggolan <painggolan flora@yahoo coms wrote:
Spam My honorable editor,
| am happy to know that our manuscript was accepted to be published in your International journal of English Language and
Sampah Literature Studies.
~ Lebih sedikit : : :
My manuscript number is DELLS/1109/2021. Anyhow,I want to confirm about the payment. Is it USD
15007 Such amount is too big for us and we'd be very happy if it can be lower.
Tamp... Sembunyikan ) ) ) k!
P y | look fowrad to hearing further information. Thank you. I — -
Fot Best reqgards. 5 - 2
PN Foto 9 Business Continuity Planning

Flora

B Dokumen Discover the tools & strategies
s CiLUll]  to keep business moving at all
i== Langganan = P R

times, in any situation.

g< o Pada Selasa,. 6 April 2021 16.53.08 WIB, AESS Journal <status@aessweb.com= menulis:
rome
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: i Dear Flora
Emall Masuk 40
Belum Dibaca Congratulations! AESS Journal o
Beilims status@aessweb.com
Gt We are happy to let you know that your article “"Exploring Foreign Language Learners’ + Tambah ke kontak
Draft 423 Perceptions during the Negotiation of Meaning: Unfocused Task and Focused Task" has
A been selected for publication in International Journal of English Language and Literature Studies.
Terkirim i E = i 5 : : A
Your article was evaluated in a blind review process by two referees. Your article will be available
Arsip online within 90 working days after receiving the publication fee.
5 :
il Important Links: 5 yahoo/mail
Sampah
A Lokl sediba 1. Journal Archive: http:,{fwww.aessweb.com,ﬂournal;;’SUlQﬁnFo!mF}re d TERATUR
2. Indexed/abstracted in: http://www.aessweb.com/journals/5019/info/fii SPESIAL

Tamp... Sembunyikan KE“E"

M Foto Publication fee: Publication Process Fee of your article is USD 1500 that includes English
editing, proofreading and processing charges. Please pay the total USD 1500 of article

B Ookmen processing charges by clicking the link below
[ Langganan — S
e e https://www.2checkout.com/checkout/purchase?sid=1987380&total=1500.008& S —= ==
cart order id=Publication%20Feefc_prod=03&id_type=28&lang=en&mode=new&fixed=Y
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] A Please remember to quote the manuscript number, IJELLS/1109/2021, whenever inquiring
Email Masuk 40 about your manuscript. After receiving your publication process fee, we will publish your article
in the upcoming issue.

; AESS Journal Q
Belum Dibaca
status@aessweb.com

Berbintang Please acknowledge the receiving of acceptance letter. + Tambah ke kantak
Draft 473
a0 We would be glad to assist you further.
Terkirim A
Arsip With best regards,
Spam == i .
David Paul > yahoo/mail
Sampah
~ Lebih sedikit Editorisl Office TERATUR
2637 E Atlantic Blvd £43110
Pompano Beach, FL 33082 SPESIAL
Tamp... Sembunyikan UsA KE“E"

Email:statusi@asssweb com;editor@sessweb.com

M roto
el IS A Dapatkan App-nya
Fax: +1-877-851-2035
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Email Mastk: £18 AESS Journal ustgtus@aessweb.conn = Sen, 26 Aprjam 1144 W
Kepada: Flora Mainggolan AESS Journal Q.
Belum Dibaca
Berbintang Thanks for your email. I have received your payment proof. Now your paper is in the production e
process. Soon you will receive the formatted copy for proofreading. S o E—
Draft 473
Teditim If you require further information, please do not hesitate to write to me. o
Arsip With Best Regards,
Spam ]
> yahoo/mail
Sampah ~ Sembunylkan pesan asli
~ Lebih sedikit On Mon, Apr 26, 2021 at 6:38 AM Flora Nainggolan <nainggolan florai@yahoo.coms wrote: ;E:aﬂn

Dear Editor.
KEREN

| have made the payment of publication fee for my manuscript (IJELLS/1109/2021) yesterday. Attached is the copy of my

M Foto
payment proof. Thank you Dapatkan App-nya

B Dokumen

Tamp... Sembunyikan

= Langganan Best Regards, e . o
Flora =

8-( Promo = —=
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Draft 473
Terkirim

Arsip

Spam

Sampah

~ Lebih sedikit

Tamp... Sembunyikan

m
B Dokumen

Foto

X
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Bl Arsipkan [ Pindahkan @ Hapus

Best Regards,
Flara

Pada Kamis, 8 April 2021 12.08.36 WIB, AESS Journal <statusi@aessweb com> menulis:

Thanks for your email. We can't reduce the fee. Please send us a scan copy of payment proof after making the payment to
start the publication process of your article. Thanks
On Wed, Apr 7, 2021 at 7:42 PM Flora Nainggolan <painggolan flora@yahoo coms wrote:

Wy honorable editor,
| am happy to know that our manuscript was accepted to be published in your International journal of English Language

and Literature Studies.

My manuscript number is DELLS/1109/2021. Anyhow,I want to confirm about the payment. Is it USD
15007 Such amount is too big for us and we'd be very happy if it can be lower.

| look fowrad to hearing further information. Thank you.
Best regards.
Flora

Pada Selasa, 6 April 2021 16.53.08 WIB, AESS Journal =statusi@aessweb com> menulis:

Memme Cle e

Pengaturan 'ﬂ'

AESS Journal o

status@aessweb.com
+ Tambah ke kontak
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TERATUR
SPESIAL
KEREN

Dapatkan App-nya
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Email Masuk 40 AESS Journal =status@aessweb.coms = % Rab, 28 Aprjam 1419 %
i T Kepada: Flora Mainggolan AESS Journal Q
) 3 statusi@aessweb.com
Berbintang Paper for Proofread: 1109-lJELLS ot
e 3 Dear Flora
Terkirim >

We are going to publish your paper in the forthcoming issue of “lIJELLS". Flease improve your paper by changing
Arsip the following:

Spam ]
T 1. Please check all the section numbers of the article. ” yahoo/mail
2 Your paper abstract should not exceed 240 words
~ Lebih sedikit 3. You should present from 6 to 10 keywords in the paper. TERATUR
4. It is necessary to review the English (English must be improved). EPESlAI.
Tamp... Sembunyikan 5. Please provide the details of mi_ssing information in the references. _ KERERN
6. Please send us ORCID profile link of all authors. If you don’t have an ORCID profile, please open the
M foto given link (www.orcid.org), create a profile and send us a link.
exaniie
B Ockunen Please send us a revised file within 48 hours by including the above comments. Otherwise, your paper will be
i= Langganan pending for publication. g T
g\ Frome MNote: We also require email id's and phone numbers of all authors and a picture of only corresponding author.
It's compulsory for our new format to add the picture of the corresponding author. We are waiting for your reply. ' n" : o @
Folder  Tampilkan 5, * ’
e | look forward to hearina from vo i o ot
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A | look forward to hearing from you. ~

Email Masuk 40

Belum Dibaca ST, AESS Journal o

Berbintang w  Sembunyikan pesan asii Sj:?rzunit;@azei?ibr;:::

Draft 423 On Mon, Apr 26, 2021 at 6:38 AM Flora Nainggolan <nainggolan florai@yahoo com= wrote:

Terkirim Dear Editor, >

Arsip | have made the payment of publication fee for my manuscript (IJELLS/1109/2021) yesterday. Attached is the copy of my

payment proof. Thank you

Spam ]
yahoo/mail

=g Best Regards

~ Lebih sedikit Flora TERATUR

SPESIAL
KEREN

Tamp... Sembunyikan

B Foto Pada Kamis. 8 April 2021 12.08.36 WIB, AESS Journal <status@aessweb com> menulis:

B Dokumen

i= Langganan Thanks for your email. We can't reduce the fee. Please send us a scan copy of payment proof after making the payment to PR T

g( . start the publication process of your article. Thanks . =
romo

On Wed, Apr 7. 2021 at 7:42 PM Flora Mainggolan <nainggolan flora@yahoo. com> wrote:

Folder Tampilkan My honorable editor, :;m ooy
b | am happy to know that our manuscript was accepted to be published in vour International journal of English Language S
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Terkirim

Arsip

Spam

Sampah

~ Lebih sedikit

Tamp... Sembunyikan

E! Foto
B Dokumen
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On Wed, Apr 7, 2021 at 7:42 PM Flora Nainggolan <nainggolan flora@yahoo. coms wrote:

My honorable editor,
| am happy to know that our manuscript was accepted to be published in your International journal of English Language
and Literature Studies.

My manuscript number is DELLS/1109/2021. Anyhow,I want to confirm about the payment. Is it USD
1500? Such amount is too big for us and we'd be very happy if it can be lower.

| look fowrad to hearing further information. Thank you.
Best regards.
Flora

Pada Selasa. 6 April 2021 16.53.08 WIB, AESS Journal <status@aessweb com> menulis:

Dear Flora

Congratulations!

We are happy to let you know that your article "Exploring Foreign L anguage Learners”’

Perceptions during the Negotiation of Meaning: Unfocused Task and Focused Task"
has been selected for publication in International Journal of English Language and Literature
Studies. Your article was evaluated in a blind review process by two referees. Your article will
be available online within 90 working days after receiving the publication fee.

Bl Arsipkan @ Pindahkan O Hapus @Y Spam e T .

Pengaturan 'I:I'

AESS Journal o

status@aessweb.com
+ Tambah ke kontak

yahoo/mail

TERATUR
SPESIAL
KEREN

Dapatkan App-nya
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Emnail Masik: E48 @ AESS Journal <status@aessweb.com= = Karn, 22 Aprjam 12.33
e Kepada: Flora Mainggolan AESS Journal A
_ Thank you. status@aessweb.com
Berbintang + Tambah ke kontak
Draft 423 ¥ Sembunyikan pesan asii
Terkirim On Thu, Apr 29, 2021 at 9:32 AM Flora Mainggolan <nainggolan floraf@yahoo.com= wrote: £
Arsip My honorable editor,
| have revised my article as it is suggested. Also | attach here the Orchid of the authors.
Spam
Thank you. hoo/ il
sampah Best regards, yaneo. mai

Flara
~ Lebih sedikit TERATUR

Pada Kamis, 29 April 2021 10.47.19 WIB, AESS Journal <status@aessweb.com= menulis: SPESIAL

Tamp... Sembunyikan KE“E"

M Foto Received with thanks.
Dapatkan App-nya

B Dokumen On Wed, Apr 28, 2021 at 9:10 PM Flora Mainggolan <nainggolan flora@yahoo com> wrote:
e My honorable editor, . e
' Lengganan nge | attach the revision as it is suggested. = =
g{ Promeo | do hope it can be published on your journal in this coming publication. =
Best regards.
Flara
Folder Tampilkan
bt Pada Rabu. 28 Apnl 2021 14
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Belum Dibaca
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Draft 473
Terkirim

Arsip

Spam

Sampah

~ Lebih sedikit

Tamp... Sembunyikan

E! Foto
B Dokumen

(F— Langganan
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Folder Tampilkan

Paper for Proofread: 1109-lJELLS

Dear Flora

VWe are going to publish your paper in the forthcoming issue of “IJELLS". Please improve your paper by
changing the following:

1. Please check all the section numbers of the article.

2. Your paper abstract should not exceed 240 words

3. You should present from 6 to 10 keywords in the paper.

4 It is necessary to review the English (English must be improved).

5. Please provide the details of missing information in the references.

6. Please send us ORCID profile link of all authors. If you don’t have an ORCID profile, please
open the given link (www.orcid.org), create a profile and send us a link.

Please send us a revised file within 48 hours by including the above comments. Otherwise, your paper will
be pending for publication.

MNote: We also require email id's and phone numbers of all authors and a picture of only corresponding
author. It's compulsory for our new format to add the picture of the corresponding author. We are waiting
for your reply.

| look forward to hearing from you.

Sincerely,

Bl Arsipkan @ Pindahkan O Hapus @Y Spam e T .

Pengaturan 'ﬂ'

AESS Journal o

status@aessweb.com
+ Tambah ke kontak
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Dapatkan App-nya
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n Sincerely, i

Email Masuk 40

On Maon, Apr 26, 2021 at 6:38 AM Flora Mainggolan <nainggolan flora@yahoo com= wrote: AESS Journal o

Belum Dibaca

Dear Editor,
Berbintang status@aessweb.com

| have made the payment of publication fee for my manuscript (IJELLS/1109/2021) yesterday. Attached is the copy of + Tambah ke kantak
Draft 423 my payment proof. Thank you
Terkirim =

; Best Regards.
Sl Flora i
Spam ]
yahoo/mail

Sampah

~ Lebih sedikit TERATUR

Pada Kamis, 8 April 2021 12.08.36 WIB, AESS Journal <status@aessweb.com> menulis: SPESIA'.

Tamp... Sembunyikan KE“E"

Thanks for your email. We can't reduce the fee. Please send us a scan copy of payment proof after making the

M Foto payment to start the publication process of your article. Thanks

B Dokumen On Wed, Apr 7, 2021 at 7:42 PM Flora Nainggolan <painggolan flora@yahoo com> wrote:

i= Langganan My honorable editor, L T

g< | am happy to know that our manuscript was accepted to be published in your International journal of English _—
Promo Language and Literature Studies.

i My manuscript number is DELLS/1109 /2021, Anyhow,I want to confirm about the payment. Is
Folder Tampilkan it USD 15007 Such amount is too big for us and we'd be very happy if it can be lower.
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Un Wed, Apr /, 2021 at /242 PM Flora Nainggolan <nainggolan tlora@yahoo.com> wrote:

il Arsipkan T Hapus

My honorable editor,
| am happy to know that our manuscript was accepted to be published in your International journal of English
Language and Literature Studies.

My manuscript number is DELLS/1109/2021. Anyhow,I want to confirm about the payment. Is
it USD 15007 Such amount is too big for us and we'd be very happy if it can be lower.

| look fowrad to hearing further information. Thank you.
Best regards,
Flara

Pada Selasa. 6 April 2021 16.53.08 WIB, AESS Journal <status@aessweb.com> menulis:

Dear Flora
Congratulations!

We are happy to let you know that your article “Exploring Foreign Language
Learners” Perceptions during the Negotiation of Meaning: Unfocused Task and
Focused Task" has been selected for publication in International Journal of English
Language and Literature Studies. Your article was evaluated in a blind review process
by two referees. Your article will be available online within 90 working days after
receiving the publication fee.
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TERATUR
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